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This was so easy.  I knew it from hello, just looking at him.  All I did is look up this pastor David
Black, and his page at LinkedIN came up, where I found he came out of Bennington College where he
majored in. . . are you ready for this? . . . Crowds and Power.  No, seriously, I didn't make that up.  But
that isn't even the best part.  He got his divinity degree at Princeton, just what you would expect from a
CIA agent, and he then got his start after college at Judson Memorial Church in Greenwich Village,
which I immediately recognized as a huge red flag, proving that.  Just go to their Wikipedia page,
where you will find that church was infiltrated long ago by the spooks.   To start with, it is a Baptist
church and David Black is allegedly a Presbyterian, so why would he go there?  In real life, Baptists
and Presbyterians have no overlap, being on opposite ends of the spectrum.  Well, maybe it is because
Judson was never really Baptist, it being a front from the beginning. 

Don't believe me?  It was founded and funded in 1888, aces and eights, by . . . John D. Rockefeller,
famous crypto-Jew and pretend Baptist.  At first its projects were small, but after WWII CIA entered in
force due to its prime location, turning it into a spearhead for its arts and propaganda projects in that
part of Manhattan.  At that time it became wildly un-Baptist, loudly championing progressive causes
like abortion and gay rights.  It also promotes horrific modern art.  By 1962 its pastor was Al Carmines,
and you have to click on his Wikipedia page to believe it.  He came out of the theater department at
Swarthmore, where he switched to divinity and was hired right out of school at age 25 to be the
associate pastor at Judson. He remained in that position for 17 years, strangely and unaccountably
never rising to pastor.  Instead he concentrated on propaganda:

https://www.linkedin.com/in/david-black-2a885b161/
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Judson_Memorial_Church


Carmines' musicals reflected his eclectic interests, including:

•Abraham Lincoln,

•Gertrude Stein,

•Aristophanes,

•Winnie the Pooh,

•and gay relationships

   
So I think we have him pegged.  Perhaps his most famous musical, which he wrote, directed, and
starred in, was called The Faggot.  It was not about a piece of firewood.  

So Judson was not your normal Baptist Church.  Donna Schaper became senior pastor in 2005, which
is sort of weird considering that Schaper is a Jewish name.   So is Carmines.  

As for David Black, he is known for using Tarot in his services, which is about as un-Christian as it
gets.  But it does fit the rest of this like a glove. 

You can even see how the shot was faked. If you watch the film, you see a guy come up from behind
Black with a white helmet on.  That helmet seems to make some sense, since you hear a lot of fake
shots being fired.  What doesn't make sense is that this guy also has on huge elbow pads, and that for
no reason he puts an elbow right up to Black's head just as the white puff goes off.  Black then
immediately grabs his head and falls down, but the hit was obviously fired at close range from the
elbow pad, and it was just a puff of powdered sugar or something, not a pepper ball or whatever they
are calling it.  Neither ICE nor anyone else would be shooting powdered sugar balls at people, as crowd
control.  If they wanted to disperse that crowd they could do it easily with one sound cannon or other
modern device.   

What have we learned? Well, I remind you of the bigger picture here.  Since I just proved this event
was staged, that tells us the entire ICE versus immigrant story is staged to further split Democrats and
Republicans, rich and poor, white and brown, left and right.  The Phoenician governors are promoting
civil war in a variety of ways now, and this is just one facet of the far larger Operation Chaos, ongoing.
They are splitting men from women, old from young, black from white, gay from straight, and left
from right, all to promote civil war instead of revolution.  They have to point you at one another to
keep you from going after them for the incredible crimes of the past decade and century, the last being
the awe-inspiring vaccine genocide, which targeted your sons and daughters, mothers and fathers,
wives and husbands.  Are you going to forget that and let them misdirect you one more time?  

https://www.infowars.com/posts/professional-protester-pastor-becomes-latest-leftist-martyr-after-ice-agents-shot-him-in-head-with-pepper-round-for-repeatedly-stepping-onto-federal-property
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Gay
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Winnie_the_Pooh
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Aristophanes
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Gertrude_Stein
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Abraham_Lincoln
https://en.wikipedia.org/wiki/Musical_theater

